
HEALING OF CERVICAL CANCER
—Testimony from an anonymous pilgrim—

Due to multiple symptoms from February to April of 2023, I had biopsies and 
scans which then revealed to be what appeared a pelvic mass. My brother in law 
who is a doctor was concerned with the reports, and with his contacts I was 
referred to the chief of NYC hospital who was the final doctor I met, and who then 
confirmed I needed surgery to remove what he was seeing, because the results 
were showing 98% chance of a mass that had metastasized.

During the days of waiting for test results and surgery my sister introduced 
me to an angel, Maria. Maria introduced me to Saint Nektarios, already being a 
big believer in Jesus Christ, praying was my peace. Prior to surgery I visited 
Saint Nektarios Monastery and shared with a couple of monks as to why I was 
there. Father Stephanos did a prayer with the relic and special cross on me, and 
I felt instant warmth. I was now days away from surgery. I put together a small 
bundle of prayers, icons of Jesus, Saint Nektarios and Mother Mary to take into 
surgery with me, all of whom got me through the dark weeks of waiting.

As I went into surgery my husband and family were waiting in Saint Patrick 
Cathedral in New York City. After 2 hours, the nurse called and said I was in 
surgery and the doctor will call to keep you informed. Within 10 minutes my 
husband’s phone rang again, and it was now the doctor. He said the words we 
have all been praying for: “She has NO CANCER. I tested and checked 
everywhere!” Surgery ended early; after a few hours I opened my eyes and was 
told about my miracle. My prayers were answered. I am forever grateful for the 
priests, intercessors and family who were along my journey who helped me pray 
and get through what was the most challenging weeks of my life. Forever grateful 
for a continued healthy beautiful life.


